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Multicom Family

― Multi apartment / multi resident wireless cellular intercom.

― 4G Enabled.

― Up to 30 family using illuminated directory screen, or up to 100 family direct 

dialling from the keypad.

― Programmable remotely by free APP.

― Store visitor codes by APP.

― Prox reader comes as standard.

Clear 
loudspeaker.

Built in 
antenna.
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Multicom Family

― Calls up to 500 families from a single SIM card.

― Visitors can scroll for residents, or enter apartment 

number to call.

― Dials up to 3 phone numbers per family on roll over.

― 4G Enabled.

― HD voice with VoLTE*.

― Programmable locally by USB PC link with free 

software, or remotely with free Android and Iphone

apps.

― Proximity card version available.

― Built in time clock for auto opening and closing of 

gates, barriers or doors in busy periods or for day time 

operation.

― 2 relays.
*Requires correct APN to be set and will only be experienced on a VoLTE enabled device.
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MULTI-LITE-IMP-KP-US

Multicom family
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Sleek, all black panel, constructed from marine 
grade stainless steel, powder coated aluminium 
hood and gloss black toughened acrylic 
faceplate. Features an illuminated nameplate 
with led indicators, illuminated keypad & prox
reader. 

MULTI-LITE-PED-KP-PX-US

Pedestal panel, constructed from marine grade 
stainless steel, powder coated aluminium hood 
and gloss black toughened acrylic faceplate. 
Features an illuminated nameplate with led 
indicators and illuminated keypad & prox
reader. 

MULTI-CL-IMP-KP-PX-US
Sleek, all black panel, constructed from marine 
grade stainless steel, powder coated aluminium 
hood and gloss black toughened acrylic 
faceplate. Features an illuminated scroll screen 
with led indicators and illuminated keypad & 
prox reader. 

MULTI-CL-PED-KP-PX-US

Pedestal panel, constructed from marine grade 
stainless steel, powder coated aluminium hood 
and gloss black toughened acrylic faceplate. 
Features an illuminated scroll screen with led 
indicators and illuminated keypad & prox
reader. 

MULTI-CL-PED-SS-KP-PX-US
Industrial all stainless, marine grade steel version 
with keypad for pedestal mount: 
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